From: Mary Harris

To: R4 Regional Hearing Clerk; Odekirk, Tristan (he/him/his)
Subject: Proof of payment

Date: Thursday, October 10, 2024 10:26:55 AM

Attachments: SKM _(C450i24100920470.pdf

Caution: This email originated from outside EPA, please exercise additional caution when
deciding whether to open attachments or click on provided links.

Good morning,
Attached is a copy of the check for proof of payment. Thank you and have a blessed day.

From: boscopier@copiahcountyms.gov [mailto:boscopier@copiahcountyms.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 09, 2024 8:48 PM

To: mharris@copiahcountyms.gov

Subject: Message from KM_C450i


mailto:mharris@copiahcountyms.gov
mailto:R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov
mailto:Odekirk.Tristan@epa.gov
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STATE OF MISSISSIPPI - COPIAH COUNTY Zwlmz»mzum
COPIAH COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS R s 85-129/842 CHECK NO.
P.O. BOX 551 « HAZLEHURST, MISSISSIPPI 39083 s renasolpapi oo 48351

s T e A I

Fourteen Thousand And No/100 Dollars
DATE AMOUNT

PAY TO THE ORDER OF: 10/ 9/2024 $14,000.00
****************************************

TREASURER, UNITED STATES OF AMERICAX** GIVEN UNDER MY HAND AND SEAL OF OFFICE
COPIAH COUNTY IND PARK WWTP DEBORAH SANDIFER, CHANCERY CLERK

DOCKET# CWA-04-2024-1023 (B) : ”
,ﬁ w@‘ﬁéﬁﬁ%&.“%mwfzﬁw

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

¥/
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DETACH THIS PORTION, RETAIN FOR YOUR RECORDS.

COPIAH COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS, COPIAH COUNTY - STATE OF MISSISSIPPI - HAZLEHURST, MISSISSIPPI
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE ACCOUNT

Account Check Date Description Invoice Amount
001341556 10/ 9/2024 CLASS 1 CONSENT AGREEMENT & 14,000.00
001341556 FINAL ORDER

Total 14,000.00







